MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTANDING
This Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) sets out a framework in which the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER agree to collaborate and cooperate in their work to support, develop and deliver high quality engagement between the two parties.  This memorandum will be effective from July 200_ until July 20__ and will form the basis for any future agreements between the parties to work collaboratively and cooperatively in support of high quality engagement between the parties.
The parties to this Memorandum understand that, except for the confidentiality clause, the MOU is not legally binding and does not create any legal rights or obligations.

1. Purpose of this memorandum
Each organisation has its own distinct area of expertise and both organisations recognise the potential for increasing their effectiveness through collaboration, consultation and, where appropriate, complementary action.  Thus, this memorandum of understanding will enable greater cooperative action by each of the parties.
2. Joint areas of interest
Within the context of this stated purpose the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER will work together in support of:

· INSERT

· ITEMS

· AS 

· APPROPRIATE

· IN 

· LIGHT

· OF 

· THE 

· STRATEGIC

· PLAN/VERBAL AGREEMENT/CURRENT PRACTICE

In pursuit of these joint areas of interest and the joint aim of supporting, developing and delivering high quality engagement between the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER each party will undertake its planned programmes of activity for the period from July 200_  and July 20__, developing and establishing their joint targets for delivery.
3. Financial commitment
There is no financial commitment from either of the two parties in respect of any activities arising from the joint areas of interest over and above commitment already made as single organisations to the aim of supporting, developing and delivering high quality engagement between them.  The parties will, however, in sharing this aim, agree that, where appropriate, the time and support of designated staff will be made available to fulfil jointly agreed activities.
The parties agree, also, jointly to seek relevant and appropriate funding from third parties to support the achievement of the parties’ shared aim.

4. Confidentiality
All parties will keep the confidentiality of the information which they receive from each other in respect of their respective businesses except where:

· The information is already known or has become lawfully known to any of the parties independently
· The information is in, or comes into, the public domain other than through wrongful use or disclosure by one of the other parties

· The use of the information is essential to the execution of activities which are agreed in this MOU

· Disclosure is required by law

“Confidential Information” is information (whether or not recorded in documentary form, or stored on any magnetic or optical disk or memory) relating to the business, products, affairs and finances of the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER for the time being confidential to the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER and trade secrets including, without limitation, technical data and know-how relating to the business of the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER or any of their business contacts.
If either party is covered by the Freedom of Information Act 2000 which gives members of the public the right to request any information that the party holds, which includes information received from third parties, such as, although not limited to: grant applicants, grant holders, panels of judges, contractors, complainants, suppliers, trustees then signing this MOU means the other party confirms their understanding of this obligation.
5. Exclusivity
Nothing in this agreement will preclude any party from dealing with the other parties on identical or similar subject matters to that covered in this agreement.

6. Intellectual Property

No pre-existing intellectual property rights will be transferred under this MOU. 

Any new intellectual property rights created under this collaboration will be equally and jointly owned by the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER.  

Any material produced jointly, or produced for joint activity, will carry the logos of the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER.

Express prior written consent must be obtained before any party uses the logos or trademarks of the others in connection with this memorandum and the joint activities arising from it.  

All parties will observe all reasonable directions given by other parties as to colour, size, manner and disposition on any materials it provides to other people. 

The SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER may develop additional material or work arising from activities undertaken as a result of this memorandum with prior written agreement of the other partner.  Such agreement must not to be unreasonably withheld, except where competitors of any party are involved.  Proper acknowledgement must be given to the other parties in such additional material or developments.
Any individual consultants working on activities relating to this memorandum will be asked to provide a written irrevocable waiver of all the individual’s statutory moral rights in the material produced and which the individual agrees to hold on trust for the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER. 

Any consultant engaged to work on activities relating to this memorandum will assign to the SCHOOL and the EMPLOYER all existing and future Intellectual Property Rights in the Works in any format, worldwide, and the Inventions and all materials embodying such rights to the fullest extent permitted by law.  

“Work” means all records, reports, documents, papers, drawings, designs, transparencies, photos, graphics, logos, typographical arrangements, software, and all other materials in whatever form, including but not limited to hard copy and electronic form, prepared by consultants in the provision of the Services covered by this MOU.  “Inventions” means any invention, idea, discovery, development, improvement or innovation made by consultants in the provision of the Services covered by this MOU, whether or not patentable or capable of registration, and whether or not recorded in any medium. 

Signed for and on behalf of the SCHOOL

Name: 

Title:

Date: ____________________

Signed for and on behalf of the EMPLOYER

Name: 


Title:




Date: ____________________


